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OPERATIONS 
AFLC designated and organized at Hill Air Force Base the 2727th Airmunitions Squadron (Test) 
and the 2728th Air-munitions Squadron (Supply) as part of the 2705th Air-munitions Wing 1 JUL 
1963 
 
 
 
 



AFLC designated and organized at Hill Air Force Base the 2727th Aimunitions Squadron (Test) 
and the 2728th Air-munitions Squadron (Supply) as part of the 2705th Air-munitions Wing, 1 Jul 
1963 
 
Effective this date was the inactivation of the 2705 Airmunitions Wing. The number 2705 reverted 
to the control of Hq AFLC and would not be used to designate a similar unit. All functions were 
consolidated with homogeneous ones within the Ogden Air Materiel Area. Civilian positions 
numbering 729 were affected in the inactivation. Personnel and positions directly reassigned to 
integrated functions in OOAMA with no change in grade or salary, totaled 627. Of the remaining 
individuals not functionally transferred, 52 were of-fered new positions in their present grade, 
while 46 persons were offered positions at lower grades. Four munitions positions were vacant and 
would not be filled. The following detachments assigned to the 2705 were affected: 1 Detachment 
11, Tooele Army Depot, Utah; Detachment 12, Hermiston, Oregon; Detachment 13, Lexington 
Army Depot, Kentucky; Detachment 14, Herlong, California. Concurrent with inactivation, 
operating locations of OOAMA were established. The following detachments and units were also 
inactivated: Detachment 1, Indian Head, Maryland; 2727 Airmunitions Squadron (Test), Hill AFB, 
Utah; 2728 Airmunitions Squadron (Supply), Hill AFB, Utah. The 2701 Explosive Ordnance 
Disposal Squadron, Hill AFB, Utah was relieved from assignment to the 2705 Airmunitions Wing 
and assigned to OOAMA as a staff office of the OOAMA Commander with a symbol of OOE. 
Detachment 63, Hq OOAMA, was activated at Indian Head, Maryland. Approximately 100 
manpower spaces were saved, along with the reduction of many higher grade positions. The new 
alignment was not to impair or disrupt SEA munitions support. 1 Nov 1969 
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